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EU EUROPE: WHERE WE ARE

• Teams in 24 countries

• Student-facing communication campaign 
across the region to support AY 2020 
recruitment and sustain student numbers 
from AY 2021

• Focus on top-sending student countries: 
France, Germany, Italy, Spain, Greece, 
Cyprus, Poland, Romania and Bulgaria
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HOW TO USE STUDY UK



WHAT IS STUDY UK?

• UK’s national campaign to promote the  UK 
to internationally mobile students:

• World-class education

• Ground-breaking research 

• Adventure and international experience

• Creativity and diversity

• Delivered by the British Council in 
partnership with the UK government’s 
GREAT Britain campaign

• Represents all of UK universities and 
colleges



WHAT IS STUDY UK?

• Website (4.8 million unique visitors 2019-
20)

• Find a university tool (nearly 40m uni leads)

• Newsletter (+44k new newsletter 
subscribers 2019-20)

• Online courses for agents and students 

• Online (and face-to-face) exhibitions, 
briefings, subject showcases and info 
sessions

• Resources for agents



STUDY UK WEBSITE: EU STUDENTS

https://study-uk.britishcouncil.org/moving-uk/eu-students

https://study-uk.britishcouncil.org/moving-uk/eu-students


STUDY UK WEBSITE: COVID-19 AND STARTING YOUR DEGREE

https://study-uk.britishcouncil.org/moving-

uk/coronavirus

https://study-uk.britishcouncil.org/moving-

uk/starting-your-degree-2020

https://study-uk.britishcouncil.org/moving-uk/coronavirus
https://study-uk.britishcouncil.org/moving-uk/starting-your-degree-2020












WHERE TO DOWNLOAD THE TOOLKIT 

Direct link:
https://study-uk.britishcouncil.org/toolkit-agents

https://study-uk.britishcouncil.org/toolkit-agents


MORE USEFUL LINKS 

Brexit

• UKCISA Brexit guidance: Detailed 
guidance for all EU students
https://www.ukcisa.org.uk/Information--
Advice/EU-EEA--Swiss-Students/Brexit-
immigration-fees-and-student-support-for-
when-you-arrive

• Universities UK International FAQs
https://www.universitiesuk.ac.uk/policy-and-
analysis/brexit/Pages/brexit-faqs.aspx

• UK Government site: Guidance for EU 
students
https://www.gov.uk/guidance/studying-in-the-
uk-guidance-for-eu-students

Covid-19

• UKCISA Coronavirus info for international 
students
https://www.ukcisa.org.uk/Information--
Advice/Studying--living-in-the-
UK/Coronavirus-Covid-19-info-for-
international-students

• Universities UK International FAQs
https://www.universitiesuk.ac.uk/Internation
al/Pages/Covid-19-intl.aspx

https://www.ukcisa.org.uk/Information--Advice/EU-EEA--Swiss-Students/Brexit-immigration-fees-and-student-support-for-when-you-arrive
https://www.universitiesuk.ac.uk/policy-and-analysis/brexit/Pages/brexit-faqs.aspx
https://www.gov.uk/guidance/studying-in-the-uk-guidance-for-eu-students
https://www.ukcisa.org.uk/Information--Advice/Studying--living-in-the-UK/Coronavirus-Covid-19-info-for-international-students
https://www.universitiesuk.ac.uk/International/Pages/Covid-19-intl.aspx


If you’d like to get in touch …

• Ellie Buchdahl: ellie.buchdahl@britishcouncil.org

• Almut Caspary: almut.caspary@britishcouncil.org

mailto:ellie.Buchdahl@britishcouncil.org
mailto:almut.caspary@britishcouncil.org

